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JMSH LLC 
Is seeking dynamic and 
enthusiastic individuals 
with interpersonal skills 
to �ll the following po-
sitions:
• Accounting Manager
• Chef
• Cooks
• Cook Helpers
• OTA Agents
• Accounting Clerk
• Purchasing
   Coordinator
• Front O�ce
   Supervisor 
• Front O�ce Agents
• Reservation Agents  
• Waitsta�
• Housekeeper 
• Houseman

Good bene�ts. If in-
terested, please come 
and pick up an applica-
tion at Holiday Resort 
Guam, Security O�ce!
(Near Matapang Beach)

eeo/aap

LUJAN & WOLFF LLP
Attorneys at Law
Suite 300, DNA Building
238 Archbishop Flores St.
Hagåtña, Guam 96910
Tel: (671)477-8064
Fax: (671)477-5297
Attorneys for Administratrix 

Kristina B. Blaz

IN THE SUPERIOR 
COURT OF GUAM

IN THE MATTER OF
THE ESTATE

OF
ANTHONY GERARD 

CRISOSTOMO BLAZ also 
known as ANTHONY C. BLAZ

Deceased,

Probate Case No.
PR0027-16

NOTICE TO 
CREDITORS

Notice is hereby given by 
the undersigned, KRISTINA 
B. BLAZ,  Administratrix of 
the Estate of ANTHONY 
GERARD CRISOSTOMO BLAZ 
also known as ANTHONY 
C. BLAZ, Decedent, to the 
Creditors of Decedent, and  all 
persons having claims against 
the said Decedent, that within 
sixty (60) calendar days
after the first publication of 
this notice, they must file 
their claims, with necessary 
vouchers, in the office of the 
Clerk of the Superior Court of 
Guam, or present their claims, 
with necessary vouchers 
to Adminstratrix at the Law 
Office of Lujan & Wolff LLP, 
Suite 300, DNA Building, 238 
Archbishop Flores Street, 
Hagåtña, Guam 96910.

Dated: 27 of December, 2019

/s/ KRISTINA B. BLAZ
Executrix

The Board of Directors of the A.B. Won Pat International 

Airport Authority, Guam (GIAA) will convene its Regu-

lar Board meeting on Friday, January 17, 2020 at 3:00 p.m. 

in Terminal Conference Room No. 3. In addition to reg-



Session will be held to discuss DFS Guam L.P. related 

litigation to which GIAA is or may be a party. Parking is 

available in the Public Parking Lot.

For special accommodations or agenda items, please call 



(This ad paid for by GIAA)

The Honorable
Lourdes A. Leon Guerrero

Governor

The Honorable
Joshua F. Tenorio

Lt.Governor

PUBLIC NOTICE

EQUAL OPPORTUNITY EMPLOYER AND DRUG FREE WORKPLACE

Oversee operations, marketing, construction management, 
lease administration and tenant relations.  Involved in the 
planning of new developments and/or acquisitions.

General Manager

Assesses company-wide developmental needs, drives training 
initiatives, identifies & arranges suitable training solutions.  
Actively searches, creatively designs and implements e�ective 
methods to educate, enhance and recognize performance.

Training and Development Manager

Primarily responsible for assisting the marketing department in 
all campaigns and promotions. Developing graphics for 
marketing materials, social media, projects, and overall 
improving the visibility of the company and its services.

More information on www.pfcguam.com. 
Send resume to ycalvo@pfcguam.com.

Graphic Designer / Marketing Assistant

Camacho Investments Corp
is looking for qualified applicants to fill the 

following positions in its subsidiaries:

CAM 5 Real Estate, LLC

Personal Finance Center

Career Opportunities

THIS ADVERTISEMENT WAS PAID WITH GOVERNMENT FUNDS BY:
Guam Behavioral Health Wellness Center

A non-refundable fee of $10.00 per bid package will be assessed.
Certified Check, Cashier’s Check, Cash will be accepted.

No personal or company check. Payment for bid package picked up 
after 3:00 pm will not be accepted.

INVITATION FOR BID
BID NO.:  
FOR: 
OPENING DATE:
PLACE:                   

BID NO.:              
FOR:                   

OPENING DATE:  
PLACE:                  

Note: Bid packages can be picked up at the General Services Agency located 
in the ITC Building, 2nd Floor, Suite 219, Tamuning, Guam or may be 
acquired from the GSA website: gsa.doa.guam.gov. Please follow instructions 
once downloaded.
GSA recommends that prospective bidders register current contact information 
with GSA to ensure they receive any notices regarding any changes or updates 
to the IFB. The procuring agency and GSA will not be liable for failure to provide 
notice to any party who did not register current contact information.

/s/  CLAUDIA S. ACFALLE
Chief Procurement Officer

EDWARD M. BIRN
Director (Direktot)

EDITH C. PANGELINAN
Deputy Director (Sigundo Direktot)

LOURDES A. LEON GUERRERO
Governor (Maga’håga)
JOSHUA F. TENORIO

Lt. Governor (Sigundo Maga’låhi)

DEPARTMENT OF 
ADMINISTRATION

DIPATTAMENTON ATMENESTRASION
GENERAL SERVICES AGENCY
(Ahensian Setbision Hinirat)

Telephone (Telifon): (671) 475-1707/1729
• Fax (Faks): (671) 472-4217/1727

IFB: GSA-002-20
OFFICE SPACE LEASE For Drug & Alcohol 
JANUARY 24, 2020     TIME: 10:00 A.M.
GENERAL SERVICES AGENCY, ITC BLDG. TAMUNING, GUAM 

IFB: GSA-003-20 
OFFICE SPACE LEASE For Guam State Tobacco 
Enforcement Prevention & Training Branch
JANUARY 24, 2020     TIME: 11:00 A.M.
GENERAL SERVICES AGENCY, ITC BLDG. TAMUNING, GUAM

We are seeking a reliable individual to �ll the following position:

Terminal Operator
Successful candidate shall perform work related to the receipt, storage and distribution of petroleum products 
as it pertains to the operation of the Cabras Distributions Terminal Tank Farm, Lique�ed Petroleum Gas Bulk 
Storage Facility, and distribution pipelines. Other duties performed shall include completion of required 
reports, inspection and routine maintenance for the terminal and equipment, product quality control, general 
housekeeping, and implementation of assigned Safe Operations & Responsibility (SOAR) systems requirements 
as assigned. Police and Tra�c clearance are required upon selection. Previous oil industry experience a plus. 
Must be able to obtain a T.W.I.C. card.

Please submit resume and complete an application packet between 9 AM thru 4 PM, Monday through Friday 
at our main o�ce across from St. John’s School in Upper Tumon. Deadline for application submission is 4pm, 
January 24th, 2020.

South Paci�c Petroleum Corporation
816 N Marine Corps Dr. FL 2

Tamuning Guam 96913-4431
ATTN: HRO Recruitment

SPPC IS AN EQUAL OPPORTUNITY EMPLOYER

JTC Services is a local company seeking to hire experienced individuals 
to work on a federal contract on Naval Station and Andersen Air Force Base.

Quality Control Monitor
Primary duties involve sampling, measuring and surveying products, processes and 
services to ensure that quality standards are met, contractual requirements, and customer’s 
expectations. The Quality Control Monitor monitors details of every product/service that our 

Other duties and assignments as directed by management.

Quality Administrator

functions in support of the Department personnel and operations; such duties include: 


communications, both in person and on the phone; produce and edit letters, memoranda, 
reports, agendas, etc. Conducts awareness training for department new hires.  Performs 
other duties and assignments as directed by management.

All prospective employees must pass a background check for Navy and Air Force Base 
access. Police and court clearance will be required prior to hire.

Download an application at www.jtcservicesguam.com
Apply in person at JTC Services 122 Archbishop Flores Street, Suite 102, Hagatna

Located behind Bank of Hawaii in Hagatna (between Alpha Insurance and Cup and Saucer).
No phone calls please
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Turn here for
your next vehicle

Discover your
new home

Find a new job
or career

Household,Jobs
Homes
Rentals

& Auto

CLASSIFIEDS
Pets &
Furniture,

Place an ad online TODAY!

Guampdn.com/Classifieds
Or call (671)472-1PDN (1736)

PDN LobbyHours: Monday–Friday 8am–5pm

Power, Water, Basic Cable, 
Internet WIFI included.

Studio - 400 SQF 

$995/Month
2-Bedroom - 750 SQF

$1,295/Month
3-Bedroom - 890 SQF 

$1,395/Month

253 Chalan Pasaheru
Front Office: 646-6961

Sarah-Property Manager: 
686-8704

(Next to Home Depot)

Tile

WE ARE HIRING
1.  WAREHOUSE WORKER / DELIVERY DRIVER

(Need valid Driver’s License)
2.  SALES ASSOCIATE (Basic computer skills is a plus)

Benefits include: Paid Vacation, Holiday Pay, 401(k)
Retirement Plan, Medical & Dental Insurance.

Apply in person at JK Tile Store (1090 Army Drive, Barrigada,
Guam 96913). No phone calls please.

AN EQUAL OPPORTUNITY EMPLOYER

The Board of Directors of the A.B. Won Pat International 

Airport Authority, Guam (GIAA) will convene its Regu-

lar Board meeting on Friday, January 17, 2020 at 3:00 p.m. 

in Terminal Conference Room No. 3. In addition to reg-



Session will be held to discuss DFS Guam L.P. related 

litigation to which GIAA is or may be a party. Parking is 

available in the Public Parking Lot.

For special accommodations or agenda items, please call 



(This ad paid for by GIAA)

The Honorable
Lourdes A. Leon Guerrero

Governor

The Honorable
Joshua F. Tenorio

Lt.Governor

PUBLIC NOTICE

We are seeking a reliable individual to �ll the following position:

Terminal Operator
Successful candidate shall perform work related to the receipt, storage and distribution of petroleum products 
as it pertains to the operation of the Cabras Distributions Terminal Tank Farm, Lique�ed Petroleum Gas Bulk 
Storage Facility, and distribution pipelines. Other duties performed shall include completion of required 
reports, inspection and routine maintenance for the terminal and equipment, product quality control, general 
housekeeping, and implementation of assigned Safe Operations & Responsibility (SOAR) systems requirements 
as assigned. Previous oil industry experience a plus. Must be able to obtain a T.W.I.C. card.

Please submit resume and complete an application packet between 9 AM thru 4 PM, Monday through Friday 
at our main o�ce across from St. John’s School in Upper Tumon. Deadline for application submission is 4pm, 
January 24th, 2020.

South Paci�c Petroleum Corporation
816 N Marine Corps Dr. FL 2

Tamuning Guam 96913-4431
ATTN: HRO Recruitment

SPPC IS AN EQUAL OPPORTUNITY EMPLOYER
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Adopted: Board Resolution No._____, [Date]  

ANTONIO B. WON PAT INTERNATIONAL AIRPORT AUTHORITY, GUAM (�GIAA�) 

TIMEKEEPING AND ATTENDANCE SYSTEM POLICY 

PURPOSE: The purpose of the Timekeeping and Attendance System Policy (the �Policy�) is to outline the 
timekeeping policies of the Antonio B. Won Pat International Airport Authority, Guam (�GIAA�). It is the 
objective of the Board of Directors and the Executive Manager of GIAA to ensure efficient time reporting 
and accountability of employee pay and benefits through utilization of a timekeeping and attendance 
system. GIAA�s Timekeeping and Attendance System (the �Timekeeping System�) is an electronic time 
tracking system that allows GIAA to accurately record, track, and report employee information in real 
time. This allows employees to accurately monitor and keep track of their time and enables GIAA to 
efficiently process employee time worked and leave taken for payroll purposes. The following 
procedures and guidelines have been created to ensure accurate recordkeeping and compliance with 
the Policy. 

COMPLIANCE: All GIAA employees must comply with the Policy. Non-exempt employees must 
accurately record time worked in accordance with this Policy. All employees must accurately record time 
away from work in accordance with this Policy. In addition, employees tasked with responsibilities under 
this Policy are required to comply with this Policy. The failure of an employee to comply with the Policy 
may result in disciplinary action in accordance with Chapter 11 of the GIAA Personnel Rules and 
Regulations. 

AUTHORITY: This Policy shall be guided by the following: 
A. GIAA Personnel Rules and Regulations promulgated on July 29, 1998; 
B. GIAA Personnel Rules and Regulations for Aviation-Related Positions Unique to Airport 

Operations and Certified, Technical and Professional Employees effective on October 1, 2008; 
C. Equal Employment Opportunity programs pursuant to guidelines of the Civil Service 

Commission; 
D. Federal and Guam Fair Labor Standards Acts;  
E. Guam Code Annotated, Title 4, Chapter 4 and Chapter 6; 
F. Overtime Compensation Memorandum for Airport Police Employees dated August 18, 2006; and 
G. Call Back Pay Policy dated July 19, 1999. 

OFFICIAL TIME OF RECORD: The Timekeeping System is the official timekeeping software for all 
employees. In order to ensure consistency of treatment for all employees, the data recorded in the 
Timekeeping System shall be considered as the �official� record of the workday at GIAA. Any dispute 
over actual hours worked, attendance or leave will be resolved by referring to the Timekeeping System 
records, unless otherwise covered by this Policy. GIAA is required by law to keep detailed records of 
time and payments for all employees. The Timekeeping System is used to record all hours worked for 
non-exempt employees. 

ASSIGNMENT OF TIME CLOCK: The Timekeeping System operates by a biometric fingerprint system. 
GIAA employees shall be assigned a time clock by the Personnel Section to �clock in� and �clock out� of 
the Timekeeping System and to view time worked.   
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DAILY CLOCK IN/OUT REQUIREMENTS: It is a job requirement that all non-exempt employees must 
clock in and clock out at the start of their shift and at the end of their shift. Employees are expected to 
clock in and out at their regularly scheduled times, when reporting on a non-scheduled workday (e.g., 
holiday, weekend, etc.), or when called back to perform emergency work. Employees must clock in no 
earlier than fourteen (14) minutes prior to the start of an employee�s work schedule and no later than 
fourteen (14) minutes after the end of the employee�s work schedule.    

LUNCH PERIOD: All non-exempt employees must clock in and clock out at the beginning and at the end 
of their scheduled lunch period, i.e., scheduled thirty (30) minute lunch period or scheduled one (1) hour 
lunch period. The lunch period is considered unpaid time. 

UNREPORTED HOURS: All hours worked must be reported using the Timekeeping System. Any time 
spent working while not clocked in, or �working off the clock,� is strictly prohibited. Employees are 
required to clock in before performing any work and to clock out after all authorized work is stopped. 
Employees that under report or fail to report hours worked may be subject to disciplinary action. 
Examples of �working off the clock� may include: 

 Forgetting to clock in or clock out 
 Voluntarily continuing to work at the end of regular working hours 
 Taking work home to complete on the weekend or in the evening 
 Working while away from the workplace (i.e., checking, reading or reviewing work-related 

emails or listening to work-related messages) 
 Answering phones, emails or attending to work while on your lunch period 

Once an employee has clocked in, the employee is responsible for starting work. When a shift has been 
completed, it is the employee�s responsibility to clock out. Employees conducting personal business or 
simply not working while clocked in may be considered �riding the clock� and may be subject to 
disciplinary action. 

CLOCK PROBLEMS: If an employee is unable to clock in or clock out at his/her designated time clock 
because of a system malfunction or under other limited conditions (e.g., off-site training), it is the 
employee�s responsibility to immediately inform his/her supervisor and to complete the Timesheet 
Adjustment Form so that time worked can be manually entered. If the correction is needed for a 
workweek that has already closed, the Timesheet Adjustment Form must be submitted to the Division 
Head so the error can be manually corrected. 

DISPUTES OVER TIME CLOCKED IN OR OUT: In the event an employee has a dispute over time that was 
clocked in or clocked out, the employee should bring it to the attention of his/her supervisor 
immediately for resolution. The Timekeeping System tracking system provides a log to assist in 
validating times of all employee check ins/outs. Any dispute that cannot be resolved using the electronic 
logs should immediately be reported to the Division Head for resolution. 

FALSIFICATION, TAMPERING AND UNAUTHORIZED VIEWING: The following infractions are prohibited 
and are considered severe: 

 Any attempt to tamper with Timekeeping System hardware or software 
 Clocking in or out for another employee 
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 Unauthorized viewing of another employee�s time in the Timekeeping System 

Employees committing these infractions may be subject to disciplinary action.   

OVERTIME: Unauthorized overtime is prohibited. Employees shall be paid overtime in accordance with 
Chapter 7 of the GIAA Personnel Rules and Regulations and the Overtime Compensation Memorandum 
for Airport Police Employees, as applicable.  

RESPONSIBILITIES: The following are responsibilities of GIAA employees under the Policy.   

1. EXECUTIVE MANAGER RESPONSIBILITY: 
A. Ensure enforcement of this Policy and applicable statutes, rules and regulations. 
B. Ensure that employees are trained and notified about this Policy and any changes thereafter.  
C. Exercise and provide leadership in personnel matters. 
D. Ensure that each employee is provided a copy of this Policy. 

2. PERSONNEL SECTIONRESPONSIBILITY: 
A. Update the Employee Master File for each employee. 
B. Load and maintain employee information in the Timekeeping System. 
C. Disseminate the Policy to employees upon implementation and upon hire.  
D. Schedule initial training for employees on the Timekeeping System. 
E. Assign employees a time clock for the purpose of timing in/out ofthe Timekeeping System. 
F. Coordinate pay guidelines for unanticipated events (e.g., typhoons, special holidays, etc.) for 

entry by the MIS Section and Accounting Division. 

3. MIS SECTION RESPONSIBILITY: 
A. Maintain the integrity of the Employee Master File. 
B. Provide system and technical support. 
C. Provide exception reports as requested by the Executive Manager, Personnel Section, 

Accounting Division, and Division Heads. 
D. Provide initial and recurrent training as well as training on an as-needed basis. 
E. Troubleshoot payroll issues related to the Timekeeping System. 

4. ACCOUNTING DIVISION RESPONSIBILITY: 
A. Review, approve and finalize all employee Timekeeping System time records. 
B. Upload time records and interface the time records to the Timekeeping System to complete the 

payroll process. 

5. DIVISION HEAD RESPONSIBILITY: 
A. Disseminate all updated Timekeeping System information to employees. 
B. Approve/disapprove an employee's leave request no later than each Monday at 12:00 p.m. 
C. Report any concerns or issues with the Timekeeping System to the MIS Section. 
D. Assign a timekeeper for their Division. 
E. Resolve any disputes over time clocked in or out. 

6. SUPERVISOR RESPONSIBILITY: 
A.  Assist employees with clock problems and ensure employees complete the Timesheet 

Adjustment Form so that time can be manually entered. 
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B. Assist employees to resolve any disputes over time clocked in or out. 
C. In the event a dispute cannot be resolved at the supervisor�s level, immediately report the 

dispute to the Division Head for resolution. 
D. Ensure that an employee�s leave entry request is complete with proper supporting documents. 
E. Assist employees by answering questions about the Policy. 

7. EMPLOYEE RESPONSIBILITY: 
A. Exercise honesty and integrity when utilizing a time clock. 
B. Understand and comply with the Policy. 
C. Utilize the time clock assigned to the employee for the purpose of timing in/out of the 

Timekeeping System. 
D. Must clock in/out to accurately record the time they begin and end work, as well as be paid 

properly. 
E. Must clock in no earlier than fourteen (14) minutes prior to the start of the employee�s work 

schedule and no later than fourteen (14) minutes after the end of the employee�s work 
schedule.   

F. Must clock in/out the beginning and ending of each scheduled lunch period, i.e., scheduled 
thirty (30) minute lunch period or scheduled one (1) hour lunch period. 

G. Must clock in/out when reporting to work on a non-scheduled workday (e.g., holiday, weekend, 
etc.) or when called back to perform emergency work.    

H. Immediately report any discrepancy in time entries to his/her supervisor.  
I. Verify time entry on a daily basis to certify the accuracy of all time recorded. 
J. Ensure that leave entry requests are complete with proper supporting documents timely 

submitted to the employee�s supervisor. 

8. TIMEKEEPERS RESPONSIBILITY: 
A. Enter employees� work schedules every pay period pursuant to the instructions of the Division 

Head. 
B. Verify employee time entry on a daily basis and make appropriate adjustments as required. 
C. Ensure adjustments and comments on an employee's time entry are accurate and approved by 

the Division Head. 
D. Notify the Division Head if there are changes or discrepancies to an employee�s time records 

due to unscheduled time entries. 
E. Verify that leave entry requests, overtime, and other time records are supported with proper 

corresponding documents. 
F. Verify time entries for holidays. 
G. Immediately notify the MIS Section if an employee encounters a problem with his/her 

fingerprint/scan. 

QUESTIONS: If employees have any questions regarding this Policy, they should direct their questions to 
their supervisor. 



ANTONIO B. WON PAT
INTERNATIONAL AIRPORT AUTHORITY, GUAM

BOARD OF DIRECTORS

EXECUTIVE SUMMARY

INVITATION FOR BID

JANITORIAL AND MAINTENANCE SERVICES
IFB NO. GIAA-002-FY20

January 17, 2020
Purpose

Board action is requested to approve the bid award for Janitorial and Maintenance Services
under the Invitation for Bid No. GIAA-002-FY19.

Background

The bid was solicited for the provision of janitorial services at the following GIAA 
designated service areas of the A.B. Won Pat International Airport, Guam’s main terminal: 
Basement Level, Apron Level, GIAA Offices & Other Areas, Transportation Security 
Administration (TSA) Offices & Facilities, and International Arrivals Corridor. 

Bidders were invited to provide alternate bids as follows:  For Alternate Bid A, bids shall 
be submitted for each service area; for Alternate Bid B, bidders must submit a lump sum 
bid for all service areas combined.

The contract will be awarded to the responsible bidder(s) with the lowest comprehensive 
and responsive bid amounts of either the two alternate bids. The contract term is for three 
(3) years with two (2) one-year option years, not to exceed five (5) years, to be exercised 
at the sole discretion of GIAA.

Procurement Background

The solicitation announcement was advertised through the local newspapers on 
November 29 and December 2, 13, and 27, 2020. The bid submission deadline was 
established for January 9, 2020 at 2:00 p.m. and bid opening took place at 2:15 p.m. 
on the same day.

Thirty (30) firms and/or individuals purchased or downloaded the bid package and 
seven (7) firms submitted a bid before the submission deadline. As required by the 
Procurement Rules and Regulations, the bid was publicly opened and read aloud by 
GIAA procurement staff in the presence of the bidders. 

The bids submitted are presented below in the order they were received and opened:

Bidder: Advance Management, Inc.



Executive Summary
IFB No. GIAA-002-FY20
Janitorial and Maintenance Services

Page 2 of 2

Alternate Bid A

Bid Item No. / Service Area Bid Amount (for 12 months)

1) Basement Level $328,161.00

2) Apron Level $375,224.00

3) GIAA Offices & Other Areas $178.997.00

4) TSA Offices & Facilities $238,662.00

5) International Arrivals 

Corridor

$119,331.00

Alternate Bid B All Service Areas (1+2+3+4+5) $1,148,495.00

Bidder: Guam Cleaning Masters

Alternate Bid A

1) Basement Level $162,988.32

2) Apron Level $295.830.15

3) GIAA Offices & Other Areas $52,000.00

4) TSA Offices & Facilities $52,000.00

5) International Arrivals 

Corridor
$53,000.00

Alternate Bid B All Service Areas (1+2+3+4+5) $564,9925.29

Bidder: ABM Aviation, Inc.

Alternate Bid A

1) Basement Level NO BID

2) Apron Level NO BID

3) GIAA Offices & Other Areas NO BID

4) TSA Offices & Facilities NO BID

5) International Arrivals 

Corridor

NO BID

Alternate Bid B All Service Areas (1+2+3+4+5) $2,446,798.63

Bidder: K Cleaning Services

Alternate Bid A

1) Basement Level $408,000.00

2) Apron Level $348,000.00

3) GIAA Offices & Other Areas $57,600.00

4) TSA Offices & Facilities $60,000.00

5) International Arrivals 

Corridor

$108,000.00

Alternate Bid B All Service Areas (1+2+3+4+5) $950,000.00

Bidder: JJ Global Services

Alternate Bid A

1) Basement Level $379,484.00

2) Apron Level $379,855.00

3) GIAA Offices & Other Areas $38,847.00

4) TSA Offices & Facilities $49,222.00

5) International Arrivals 

Corridor

$265,652.00

Alternate Bid B All Service Areas (1+2+3+4+5) $1,001,420.00

Bidder: Unique Pacific Resources

1) Basement Level $364,800.00



Executive Summary
IFB No. GIAA-002-FY20
Janitorial and Maintenance Services

Page 2 of 3

Alternate Bid A

2) Apron Level NO BID

3) GIAA Offices & Other Areas NO BID

4) TSA Offices & Facilities NO BID

5) International Arrivals 

Corridor

NO BID

Alternate Bid B All Service Areas 

(1+2+3+4+5)

NO BID

Bidder: G-Crew Maintenance

Alternate Bid A 1) Basement Level $274,950.00

2) Apron Level $284,994.00

3) GIAA Offices & Other Areas $38,896.00

4) TSA Offices & Facilities $39,840.00

5) International Arrivals 

Corridor

$129,850.00

Alternate Bid B All Service Areas 

(1+2+3+4+5)

$767,293.50

The lowest Alternate Bid B total bid is lower than the total of the lowest bids submitted for 
Alternate Bid A.  The lowest Alternate Bid B bid was submitted by Guam Cleaning Masters 
in the amount of $564,992.29 per year.

Legal Review

Upon approval of award, the contract will be processed through the issuance of a contract 
& subject to legal review.

Financial Review

The total contract award for this bid is a total annual cost of $564,992.29 per year for a 
term of three (3) years with two (2) one-year option years, not to exceed five (5) years, to 
be exercised at GIAA’s sole discretion. Funding for this contract is available under the 
Property & Facilities Division O&M Budget.

Recommendation

Management recommends the contract award in the amount of $564,992.29 per year for 
all service areas with a contract term of three (3) years with two (2) one-year option years
to Guam Cleaning Masters, who has been determined to have met the standards of 
responsibility and responsiveness outlined in the Guam Procurement Law and Regulations.
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ANTONIO B. WON PAT
INTERNATIONAL AIRPORT AUTHORITY, GUAM

BOARD OF DIRECTORS

EXECUTIVE SUMMARY

INVITATION FOR BID

GROUNDS MAINTENANCE SERVICES
IFB NO. GIAA-003-FY20

January 17, 2020
Purpose

Board action is requested to approve the bid award for Grounds Maintenance Services
under the Invitation for Bid No. GIAA-003-FY19.

Background

The IFB solicited grass cutting and maintenance services for the following GIAA 
designated service areas: Airport Operations (Secured Area), North Tiyan - Maga Haga
Highway (Non-Secured Area), South Tiyan (Non-Secured Area), and Airport Industrial 
Park (Non-Secured Area). 

Bidders were invited to provide alternate bids as follows:  For Alternate Bid A, bids shall 
be submitted for each service areas; for Alternate Bid B, bidders must submit a lump sum 
bid for all service areas combined. 

The contract will be awarded to the responsible bidder(s) with the lowest comprehensive 
and responsive bid amounts of either the two alternate bids. The contract term is for three 
(3) years with two (2) one-year option years, not to exceed five (5) years, to be exercised 
at the sole discretion of GIAA.

Procurement Background

The solicitation announcement was advertised through the local newspapers on 
December 6, 10, and 16, 2020. The bid submission deadline was established for 
January 10, 2020 at 2:00 p.m. and bid opening took place at 2:15 p.m. on the same 
day.

Twenty-nine (29) firms and/or individuals purchased or downloaded the bid package 
and nine (9) firms submitted a bid before the submission deadline. As required by the 
Procurement Rules and Regulations, the bid was publicly opened and read aloud by 
GIAA procurement staff in the presence of the bidders. 
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The bids submitted are presented below in the order they were received and opened:

Bidder: Guam Cleaning Masters

Alternate Bid A

Bid Item No. / Service Area Bid Amount 

(for 12 months):

1) Airport Operations (Secured Area) $211.111.00

2) North Tiyan, Maga Haga Highway (Non-Secured 

Area)

$99,999.99

3) South Tiyan (Non-Secured Area) $28,000.00

4) Airport Industrial Park (Non-Secured Area) $33,000.00

Alternate Bid B All Service Areas (1+2+3+4) $355,555.55

Bidder: GET, LLC.

Alternate Bid A

1) Airport Operations (Secured Area) NO BID

2) North Tiyan, Maga Haga Highway (Non-Secured 

Area)

$141,372.00

3) South Tiyan (Non-Secured Area) $111,492.00

4) Airport Industrial Park (Non-Secured Area) $113,220.00

Alternate Bid B All Service Areas (1+2+3+4) NO BID

Bidder: K Cleaning Services

Alternate Bid A

1) Airport Operations (Secured Area) NO BID

2) North Tiyan, Maga Haga Highway (Non-Secured 

Area)

$138,000.00

3) South Tiyan (Non-Secured Area) $62,000.00

4) Airport Industrial Park (Non-Secured Area) NO BID

Alternate Bid B All Service Areas (1+2+3+4) NO BID

Bidder: Service Management Corporation

Alternate Bid A

1) Airport Operations (Secured Area) $498,500.00

2) North Tiyan, Maga Haga Highway (Non-Secured 

Area)

NO BID

3) South Tiyan (Non-Secured Area) NO BID

4) Airport Industrial Park (Non-Secured Area) NO BID

Alternate Bid B All Service Areas (1+2+3+4) NO BID

Bidder: Unique Pacific Resources

Alternate Bid A

1) Airport Operations (Secured Area) NO BID

2) North Tiyan, Maga Haga Highway (Non-Secured 

Area)

$79,980.80

3) South Tiyan (Non-Secured Area) $27,890.80

4) Airport Industrial Park (Non-Secured Area) $88,980.80

Alternate Bid B All Service Areas (1+2+3+4) NO BID

Bidder: JJ Global Services

1) Airport Operations (Secured Area) $184,949.00
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Alternate Bid A

2) North Tiyan, Maga Haga Highway (Non-Secured 

Area)

$94,499.00

3) South Tiyan (Non-Secured Area) $27,700.00

4) Airport Industrial Park (Non-Secured Area) $31,999.00

Alternate Bid B All Service Areas (1+2+3+4) $289,485.00

Bidder: Maids To Order, Inc.

Alternate Bid A

1) Airport Operations (Secured Area) NO BID

2) North Tiyan, Maga Haga Highway (Non-Secured 

Area)

$80,388.00

3) South Tiyan (Non-Secured Area) $60,984.00

4) Airport Industrial Park (Non-Secured Area) $73,180.80

Alternate Bid B All Service Areas (1+2+3+4) NO BID

Bidder: G-Crew Maintenance

Alternate Bid A

1) Airport Operations (Secured Area) NO BID

2) North Tiyan, Maga Haga Highway (Non-Secured 

Area)

$104,995.00

3) South Tiyan (Non-Secured Area) $49,895.00

4) Airport Industrial Park (Non-Secured Area) $59,895.00

Alternate Bid B All Service Areas (1+2+3+4) NO BID

Bidder: The Pit, LLC.

Alternate Bid A

1) Airport Operations (Secured Area) $263,874.25

2) North Tiyan, Maga Haga Highway (Non-Secured 

Area)
$75,145.58

3) South Tiyan (Non-Secured Area) $43,182.76

4) Airport Industrial Park (Non-Secured Area) $81,201.00

Alternate Bid B All Service Areas (1+2+3+4) $463,403.59

The lowest Alternate Bid B total bid is lower than the total of the lowest bids submitted for 
Alternate Bid A.  The lowest Alternate Bid B bid was submitted by JJ Global Services in 
the amount of $289,485.00 per year.

Legal Review

Upon approval of award, the contract will be processed through the issuance of a contract 
& subject to legal review.

Financial Review

The total contract award for this bid is $289,485.00 per year for a term of three (3) years 
with two (2) one-year option years, not to exceed five (5) years, to be exercised at GIAA’s 
sole discretion. Funding for this contract is available under the Property & Facilities 
Division O&M Budget.
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Recommendation

Management recommends the contract award in the amount of $289,485.00 per year for 
all service areas with a contract term of three (3) years with two (2) one-year option years
to JJ Global Services, who has been determined to have met the standards of responsibility 
and responsiveness outlined in the Guam Procurement Law and Regulations.

































TA NO. NAME COST TRAVEL DATES PURPOSE DESTINATION

20-10-01 Bamba, Brian J. $7,586.95 10/22/2019 - 10/31/2019

Traveller attended meetings with the Airport Finance 
team, GIAA Bond Underwriters, Bond Counsel, GEDA 

Representatives, to discuss potential investors, pricing , 
and sale of GIAA Revenue Refunding Bonds, 2019 Series 

A&B.

New York

20-10-02 Ada, Thomas C. $7,586.95 10/22/2019 - 10/31/2019 

Traveller attended meetings with the Airport Finance 
team, GIAA Bond Underwriters, Bond Counsel, GEDA 

Representatives, to discuss potential investors, pricing , 
and sale of GIAA Revenue Refunding Bonds, 2019 Series 

A&B. 

New York                               

Traveller attended meetings with the Airport Finance 

FY 2020 TRAVEL REPORT
BOARD RATIFICATION - October - December

20-10-03 Rios, John A. $7,586.95 10/22/2019 - 10/31/2019

Traveller attended meetings with the Airport Finance 
team, GIAA Bond Underwriters, Bond Counsel, GEDA 

Representatives, to discuss potential investors, pricing , 
and sale of GIAA Revenue Refunding Bonds, 2019 Series 

A&B.

New York

20-10-06 Sobti, Gurvinder Singh $7,586.95 10/22/2019 - 10/31/2019

Traveller attended meetings with the Airport Finance 
team, GIAA Bond Underwriters, Bond Counsel, GEDA 

Representatives, to discuss potential investors, pricing , 
and sale of GIAA Revenue Refunding Bonds, 2019 Series 

A&B.

New York

20-11-14 Quinata, John M. $2,804.98 11/21/2019 - 11/22/2019 Traveller attended the 19th Pacific Region Investment 
Conference (PRIC). Makati, Philippines

20-11-15 Rios, John A. $2,804.98 11/21/2019 - 11/22/2019 Traveller attended the 19th Pacific Region Investment 
Conference (PRIC). Makati, Philippines

20-11-22 Morato, Doyon A. $1,656.35 11/21/2019 - 11/23/2019 Traveller attended meetings with Jeju Air Airline Officials. Seoul, Korea

20-12-19 Tainatongo, Rosie M.R. $3,245.00 12/3/2019 - 12/04/2019 Traveller will be attended the 2019 FAA Civil Rights 
Training. Honolulu, Hawaii









             
          
          

           





 

 

          

          



 



            





 

 

 

 

 

 

 


 

             
            









 
                


 


   
           
           
           


           

     


 
               
                 
                
          


 


           
          
           







            
             




 


 



             


 











 
 
 
 

 
 

 
 

 





 
 

 
 

 

 


 
   

 
 

 
 
 

 
          

 
 

       
        
 

         
          
 

         
       
 

          
        
 


 

 
 

         





          
 

 
 

 

 
           



             
 

 
 










            


           
 
 

 
         
 

 
  

  
 

 

 
          


         

           
 

 

 
 

     
 

 
   
            
 

 
           

 
 

 
 
 





Page 2 – Operating Results as of November 30, 2019 

Year-to-date Total Signatory Revenues for the month ending November 30, 2019 are below Budgeted 
revenues by 5.3%.  Signatory revenue estimates are based on projections submitted by Signatory 
airlines and adopted in the annual budget. 

Year-to-date Total Concession Revenues are -0.2% below budget while Passenger Facility Charges 
are below the budget estimate by -1.1%.

Year-to-date Total Other Revenues, inclusive of non-signatory and non-airlines revenues, are above 
the budget estimate by 8.5%. 

Year-to-date Total Operating Revenues actual of $12.5M is -0.9% below the budget estimate of 
$12.6M. 

Year-to-date Total Operating Expenses are below budget by -17.7%.  Components of this line item 
include a -9.4% decrease in Personnel Service, a -19.7% decrease in Contractual Services, a -83.0% 
decrease in Materials & Supplies and a 0.0% decrease in Equipment/Furnishings from budgeted 
amounts for these respective categories. 

The actual year-to-date Net Revenues from Operations of $5.6M represents a 33.1% increase over 
the year-to-date budgeted amount of $4.2M. 

Finally, our year-to-date results for Debt Service Coverage is at 1.53 versus the requirement of 1.25. 

Should you have any questions, please contact me at your convenience. 

Attachments 

Cc: Board of Directors  
 Executive Manager 
 Deputy Executive Manager 
 Airport Services Manager 



GUAM INTERNATIONAL AIRPORT AUTHORITY
KEY OPERATING RESULTS ($000's)

As of November 30, 2019

CURRENT MONTH YEAR TO DATE FULL YEAR FORECAST
Actual Budget Actual %Var Budget Actual Budget Actual %Var %Var
FY2019 FY2020 FY2020 Bud Vs Act'l Full Year FY2019 FY2020 FY2020 Bud Vs Act'l Actual/Est Bud Vs Act'l

I. Signatory Airline Rents & Fees
Terminal Bldg Rentals 353.2 329.8 327.3 0.8% 3,997.2 709.6 669.1 654.4 2.2% 3,982.6 0.4%
Departure Fees 659.1 616.5 594.4 3.6% 7,385.1 1,264.9 1,235.7 1,165.9 5.6% 7,315.4 0.9%
Arrival Fees 687.1 624.5 591.1 5.3% 7,320.2 1,312.7 1,258.1 1,149.1 8.7% 7,211.1 1.5%
Immigration Inspection Fees 242.0 224.4 215.9 3.8% 2,642.6 460.5 451.3 421.6 6.6% 2,612.8 1.1%
Loading Bridge Use Fees 456.8 674.0 647.5 3.9% 8,245.3 927.4 1,417.9 1,331.3 6.1% 8,158.7 1.1%
Apron Use Fees 106.8 117.8 122.5 4.0% 1,413.5 208.2 248.0 243.4 1.9% 1,408.9 0.3%
Landing Fees 243.8 264.3 291.8 0.0% 3,170.7 482.4 556.2 562.7 0.0% 3,177.2 0.0%

Total Signatory Revenue 2,748.9 2,851.3 2,790.6 ‐2.1% 34,174.7 5,365.7 5,836.4 5,528.4 ‐5.3% 33,866.7 ‐0.9%

Enplaned Signatory Pax 149,055 163,736 157,717 3.7% 1,961,267 286,414 328,159 309,265 5.8% 1,942,373 1.0%

Cost per Enplaned Pax $18.44 $17.41 $17.69 1.6% $17.42 $18.73 $17.79 $17.88 0.5% $17.44 0.1%

Revenues from Sources other than
Signatory Airlines Rents & Fees

Concession Revenues
Gen Mdse (DFS) 990.6 1,090.9 1,112.3 2.0% 14,528.0 2,181.8 2,181.8 2,210.5 1.3% 14,556.7 0.2%
Inflight Catering 74.7 71.6 71.9 0.5% 908.0 149.5 144.0 146.3 1.6% 910.3 0.3%
Food & Beverage 83.4 84.2 94.7 12.4% 1,042.7 162.2 165.3 185.8 12.4% 1,063.2 2.0%
Rental Cars 135.9 142.0 133.8 5.8% 1,840.5 274.8 276.0 257.8 6.6% 1,822.3 1.0%
Other Concession Rev 73.5 73.7 55.5 24.7% 694.9 141.6 149.0 109.0 26.8% 654.9 5.8%

Total Concession Revenues 1,358.1 1,462.5 1,468.3 0.4% 19,014.0 2,909.9 2,916.0 2,909.5 ‐0.2% 19,007.5 0.0%

Passenger Facility Charges 596.4 646.9 746.0 15.3% 7,749.0 1,047.9 1,296.6 1,282.1 1.1% 7,734.6 0.2%

Other Revenue 1,474.7 1,304.9 1,403.8 7.6% 15,426.4 2,979.9 2,588.9 2,807.8 8.5% 15,645.2 1.4%

Total Operating Revenue 6,178.2 6,265.6 6,408.6 2.3% 76,364.0 12,303.4 12,637.8 12,527.8 ‐0.9% 76,254.0 ‐0.1%

II. Operating Expenses:
Personnel Services 1,581.4 1,707.1 1,522.7 10.8% 22,191.8 3,174.0 3,414.2 3,092.8 9.4% 21,870.4 1.4%
Contractual Services 1,917.4 2,757.6 1,814.9 34.2% 27,018.0 3,844.8 4,763.8 3,824.3 19.7% 26,078.5 3.5%
Materials & Supplies 22.5 198.6 19.7 90.1% 2,765.7 40.9 280.6 47.6 83.0% 2,532.7 8.4%
Equipment/Furnishings 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0% 517.8 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0% 517.8 0.0%

Total Operating Expenses 3,521.2 4,663.2 3,357.3 ‐28.0% 52,493.2 7,059.7 8,458.5 6,964.7 ‐17.7% 50,999.4 ‐2.8%

Net income from Operations 2,657.0 1,602.4 3,051.3 90.4% 23,870.8 5,243.7 4,179.3 5,563.1 33.1% 25,254.6 5.8%
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GUAM INTERNATIONAL AIRPORT AUTHORITY
KEY OPERATING RESULTS ($000's)

As of November 30, 2019

CURRENT MONTH YEAR TO DATE FULL YEAR FORECAST
Actual Budget Actual %Var Budget Actual Budget Actual %Var %Var
FY2019 FY2020 FY2020 Bud Vs Act'l Full Year FY2019 FY2020 FY2020 Bud Vs Act'l Actual/Est Bud Vs Act'l

III. Other Revenues and Expenses

Less: Non Operating Expense(Ret/DOI/OHS) 45.2 0.0 63.5 0.0% 800.0 316.1 436.0 334.5 23.3% 698.5 12.7%

Add: Interest on Investments 90.0 88.5 80.7 8.8% 1,203.8 152.5 149.5 175.1 17.1% 1,229.4 2.1%

Net Revenues 2,701.8 1,690.9 3,068.5 81.5% 24,274.6 5,080.1 3,892.8 5,403.7 0.7 25,785.5 6.2%

Add: Other Sources of Funds 14.4 33.3 14.4 0.0% 400.0 29.3 66.7 41.9 0.0% 375.2 0.0%

Add: Other Available Moneys 530.0 529.9 529.9 0.0% 6,358.8 1,060.0 1,059.8 1,059.8 0.0% 6,358.8 0.0%

Net Revenues and Other
Available Moneys 3,246.3 2,254.2 3,612.8 60.3% 31,033.4 6,169.4 5,019.3 6,505.4 29.6% 32,519.5 4.8%

Debt Service payments 2,120.0 2,119.6 2,119.6 0.0% 25,435.3 4,240.1 4,239.2 4,239.2 0.0% 25,435.3 0.0%

Debt Service Coverage 1.53 1.06 1.70 60.3% 1.22 1.46 1.18 1.53 29.6% 1.28 4.8%

Debt Service Requirement 1.25 1.25 1.25 1.25 1.25 1.25 1.25 1.25
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Enplanements October November December January February March April May June July August September Total
Projection per Budget FY 2020 164,423 163,736 172,792 175,385 163,341 169,140 151,816 158,800 160,982 163,106 164,179 153,567 1,961,267
FY 2018 Actual Enplanements 129,772 145,309 157,750 155,969 145,088 157,932 139,620 142,477 146,720 153,951 162,801 129,698 1,767,087
FY 2019 Actual Enplanements 137,359 149,055 164,554 172,617 155,215 169,061 137,139 147,855 148,080 158,771 182,370 153,899 1,875,975
FY 2020 Actual Enplanements/Projection 151,548 157,717 172,792 175,385 163,341 169,140 151,816 158,800 160,982 163,106 164,179 153,567 1,942,373

FY 2020 versus FY 2019 Monthly% 10.33% 5.81% 5.01% 1.60% 5.24% 0.05% 10.70% 7.40% 8.71% 2.73% -9.97% -0.22% 3.54%
FY 2020 versus FY 2019 Monthly 14,189 8,662 8,238 2,768 8,126 79 14,677 10,945 12,902 4,335 -18,191 -332 66,398
FY 2020 versus FY 2019 Cumulative 14,189 22,851 31,089 33,856 41,982 42,061 56,738 67,683 80,585 84,921 66,730 66,398 66,398

10.33% 15.33% 18.89% 19.61% 27.05% 24.88% 41.37% 45.78% 54.42% 53.49% 36.59% 43.14% 3.54%

Enplanements October November December January February March April May June July August September Total
Actual Enplanements FY 2020 151,548 157,717 172,792 175,385 163,341 169,140 151,816 158,800 160,982 163,106 164,179 153,567 1,942,373
Projection per Budget FY 2020 164,423 163,736 172,792 175,385 163,341 169,140 151,816 158,800 160,982 163,106 164,179 153,567 1,961,267
Actual Enplanements Over/(Under) Projection (12,875) (6,019) 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 (18,894)

  Cumulative Total (12,875) (18,894) 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 -1.0%

October November December January February March April May June July August September 

%  Monthly versus Projection -7.8% -3.7% 0.0% 0.0% 0.0% 0.0% 0.0% 0.0% 0.0% 0.0% 0.0% 0.0%
%  Cumulative Total -7.8% -5.8% 0.0% 0.0% 0.0% 0.0% 0.0% 0.0% 0.0% 0.0% 0.0% 0.0%

October November December January February March April May June July August September 
Actual Enplanements 151,548 157,717 172,792 175,385 163,341 169,140 151,816 158,800 160,982 163,106 164,179 153,567

Month to Month Increase/(Decrease) 6,169 15,075 2,593 -12,044 5,799 -17,323 6,984 2,182 2,124 1,073 -10,612
Month to Month Increase/(Decrease) in % 4.1% 9.6% 1.5% -6.9% 3.6% -10.2% 4.6% 1.4% 1.3% 0.7% -6.5%

CPE CPE FY20
 Forecast Per FY2020 Budget 18.16$                 17.41$                17.06$           17.04$          17.12$      17.23$              17.77$         17.52$          17.19$      17.55$      17.34$          17.81$                 17.42$                 
 Actual CPE 18.07$                17.69$               

   Variance 0.09$                    (0.28)$                 17.06$           17.04$          17.12$      17.23$              17.77$         17.52$          17.19$      17.55$      17.34$          17.81$                 17.42$                 

Cost Per Enplanement FY2019 Actual versus Projected

SUMMARY SIGNATORY AIRLINES

Actual versus Forecast

Percentage Over/(Under) Forecast

Month to Month Trend

135,000

140,000

145,000

150,000

155,000

160,000

165,000

170,000

175,000

180,000

October November December January February March April May June July August September

FY 2018 FY 2020 SignatoryAirlines Actual and Projectionof Enplanements

Projection per Budget FY 2020 FY 2020 Actual Enplanements

135,000

140,000

145,000

150,000

155,000

160,000

165,000

170,000

175,000

180,000

October November December January February March April May June July August September

Fiscal Year 2020 Actual Enplanements versus Budget

Actual Enplanements FY 2020 Projection per Budget FY 2020




