












 

BOARD OF DIRECTORS REGULAR MEETING 
3:00 p.m., Friday, December 19, 2025 

GIAA CONFERENCE ROOMS 1 & 2 
 

Videoconference and Live Streamed via: https://www.guamairport.com or  
https://www.guamairport.com/corporate/about-our-airport/board-of-directors/airport-board-meeting 

 
Public Notice 

First Notice: 
The Guam Daily Post – Friday, December 12, 2025 

Notice to Media – Friday, December 12, 2025 
 

Second Notice: 
The Guam Daily Post – Wednesday, December 17, 2025 

Notice to Media – Wednesday, December 17, 2025 

 

 

AGENDA 
 

1.  Call to Order and Attendance 

2. Approval of Agenda 

3. Approval of Minutes  

A. November 13, 2025, Regular Board Meeting 

4. Correspondence – None 

5. Old Business – None 

6. New Business 

A. Approval and Award of Purchase and Delivery of Zero Emission Vehicles (ZEV)  

and Charging Stations − IFB No.: GIAA-005-FY25 

B. Approval of Legal Services 2025 Invoice Nos. 156132−156201  

and 156219 − 156220  
7. Report of Executive Manager 

A. Airport Updates 

B. Announcements  

8. Report of Comptroller  

9. Public Comments 

10. Adjournment 

 

 

 

 

 

 

https://www.guamairport.com/
https://www.guamairport.com/corporate/about-our-airport/board-of-directors/airport-board-meeting
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Draft Meeting Minutes – November 13, 2025 

 
  
 

MINUTES OF THE REGULAR MEETING OF THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE 
A.B. WON PAT INTERNATIONAL AIRPORT AUTHORITY, GUAM 

Thursday, November 13, 2025, 3:00 p.m. 
GIAA CONFERENCE ROOMS 1 & 2 

 
 
1. CALL TO ORDER AND ATTENDANCE 
 
The November regular meeting of the Board of Directors of the A.B. Won Pat International Airport 
Authority, Guam (“GIAA” or the “Authority”) was held on November 13, 2025, and called to order 
by Chairman Brian J. Bamba at 3:16 p.m. at the GIAA Terminal Conference Rooms 1 & 2, 355 Chalan 
Pasaheru, Tamuning, Guam, 96913.   
 
Directors Present:    Offices or Positions:      
Brian J. Bamba     Chairman 
Gurvinder S. Sobti    Vice Chairman 
Lucy M. Alcorn    Director 
Doyon A. Morato    Director 

Jesse G. Garcia     Director 
 
Directors Absent:    Offices or Positions:   
Donald I. Weakley     Board Secretary 
Rosie R. Tainatongo    Director 
 
GIAA Officials:     Offices or Positions:  
John M. Quinata     Executive Manager 
Artemio R.A. Hernandez, Ph.D.  Deputy Executive Manager 
Jean M. Arriola    Airport Services Manager 
Dafne Mansapit Shimizu   Comptroller 
Kathrina Bayson    Supply Management Administrator   
Juan Reyes     Air Terminal Manager 
Anthony Quidachay    Safety Administrator 
Fidel Masga     Assistant Chief of Police 
Elpidio C. Antenor     Engineer III (Electrical) 
Vanessa Pangindian    Management Analyst III 
Ralph “Billy” Gutierrez II   Management Analyst IV    
        
William Brennan     Arriola Law Firm, GIAA Legal Counsel 
Frank Santos     TMG, GIAA Consultant 
 
 
Chairman Bamba welcomed Airport tenants, stakeholders, and members of the public who are 
noted in a sign-in sheet attached to these minutes.   
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2. APPROVAL OF AGENDA 
 
On motion duly made by Vice Chairman Sobti, seconded by Director Alcorn, the following resolution 
was unanimously passed:  
 

Resolution No. 26-09 
The Board hereby approves the agenda of November 13, 2025, regular meeting, as presented. 
 
3. APPROVAL OF MINUTES 
 

A. September 29, 2025, Regular Board Meeting 
 
On motion duly made by Vice Chairman Sobti, seconded by Director Morato, the following 
resolution was unanimously passed:  
 

Resolution No. 26-10 
The Board hereby approves the minutes of September 29, 2025, Regular Meeting, subject to 
corrections. 
 
4. CORRESPONDENCE 
 
Executive Manager (EM) Quinata advised there was no Correspondence to report. 
 
5. OLD BUSINESS 
 
EM Quinata advised there was no Old Business to be presented. 
 
6. NEW BUSINESS 
 

A. Approval and Award of Security Screening Checkpoint Area Expansion − Design − RFP 
No. RFP−014−FY25 
 

Deputy Executive Manager Artemis “Ricky” Hernandez (“DEM Hernandez”) presented this item to 
the Board. Board action was requested to approve the ranking results for Request for Proposals 
(RFP) No. RFP−014−FY25, to design the Security Screening Checkpoint Area Expansion at the 
Antonio B. Won Pat International Airport, Guam (“GIAA”).  
 
The referenced Request for Proposals (RFP) solicits interest from qualified firms and/or individuals 
to design the expansion of the Transportation Security Administration’s (TSA) Security Screening 
Checkpoint (SSCP) area, located on the departure level (2nd Floor) above the ticketing lobby. The 
current 3,500−square−foot screening area, which includes queuing lanes for Travel Document 
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Check (TDC) podiums and a dedicated lane for TSA Precheck passengers, has become inadequate to 
accommodate passenger volumes based on pre-COVID levels and anticipated future demand. It 
involves the integration and secure redesign of the corridor from U.S. Customs and Border 
Protection (USCBP) Immigration Hall through Door 202 to provide direct, controlled access into the 
TSA Security Screening area for transit passengers and airline crew members, including necessary 
modifications to align with TSA and CBP operational and security requirements. 
 
The RFP was publicly announced in a local newspaper on August 27, September 5 and 22, 2025. The 
deadline to submit proposals was September 29, 2025, at 4:00 p.m.  
 
A total of twenty-one (21) firms and/or individuals downloaded the RFP package, and three (3) firms 
submitted a proposal before the submission deadline. 
 
The proposals were reviewed to determine responsiveness, that is, whether or not the offeror 
submitted all documents required by the RFP. All three (3) offerors submitted the required 
documents and were determined to be responsive as outlined in the Guam Procurement Law and 
Regulations. 
 
The Evaluation Committee appointed by the Executive Manager completed their evaluations of the 
proposal. As a result of the evaluations, it was determined that Offeror C met the standards of 
responsibility and responsiveness to perform the required services in accordance with the criteria 
set forth in the RFP. The score sheets were gathered and tabulated by the Procurement Office. 
 
Upon Board approval of the ranking results, subject to negotiation of fair and reasonable fees and 
terms of an agreement, the same will be forwarded to Legal Counsel for review and approval as to 
form.  
 
The term of the agreement is for five (5) years, subject to the availability of funding. 
 
The Security Screening Checkpoint Area Expansion − Design will be funded under an FAA AIP grant; 
Federal Share is 90% and Sponsor Share 10%. 
 
On motion duly made by Director Morato, seconded by Secretary Weakley, the following resolution 
was unanimously passed:  
 

Resolution No. 26-11 
The Board hereby moves to approve the ranking results and the contract award to Offeror C 
subject to negotiation of fair and reasonable fees to be submitted at a time and in a format 
determined by GIAA. 
 
After the Board approved the ranking results, Offeror C was publicly announced as E&A Engineers. 
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B. Approval of Award for Airfield Lighting and Electrical System Modernization − Design − 
RFP No. RFP-012-FY25 
 

DEM Hernandez presented this item to the Board. Board action was requested to approve the 
ranking results for Request for Proposals (RFP) No. RFP−012−−FY25, to design the Airfield Lighting 
and Electrical System Modernization at the Antonio B. Won Pat International Airport, Guam 
(“GIAA”). 
 
The referenced Request for Proposals (RFP) solicits interest from qualified firms and/or individuals 
to design and modernize the airfield and electrical system to enhance safety, reliability, and energy 
efficiency. Although vault upgrades were completed in 2015, further improvements are needed to 
meet evolving aviation demands. This project will allow the airport to improve runway/taxiway 
visibility, reduce the frequency of lighting system failures and integrate sustainable, energy-efficient 
technologies. Enhancements will ensure compliance with FAA standards, support GIAA’s 
operational needs, and strengthen the airport’s role as a vital regional hub for Micronesia. 
 
The RFP was publicly announced in a local newspaper on September 16 and 22, and October 9, 2025. 
The deadline to submit proposals was October 16, 2025, at 4:00 p.m. 
 
A total of twenty (20) firms and/or individuals downloaded the RFP package, and two (2) firms 
submitted a proposal before the submission deadline. 
 
The proposals were reviewed to determine responsiveness, that is, whether or not the offeror 
submitted all documents required by the RFP. Both offerors submitted the required documents and 
were determined to be responsive as outlined in the Guam Procurement Law and Regulations. 
 
The Evaluation Committee appointed by the Executive Manager completed their evaluations of the 
proposal. As a result of the evaluations, it was determined that Offeror B met the standards of 
responsibility and responsiveness to perform the required services in accordance with the criteria 
set forth in the RFP. The score sheets were gathered and tabulated by the Procurement Office. 
 
Upon Board approval of the ranking results, subject to negotiation of fair and reasonable fees and 
terms of an agreement, the same will be forwarded to Legal Counsel for review and approval as to 
form. 
 
The term of the agreement is for five (5) years, subject to the availability of funding. 
 
The Airfield Lighting and Electrical System Modernization - Design will be funded under an FAA AIP 
grant, Federal Share is 90% and Sponsor Share 10%. 
 
On motion duly made by Director Garcia, seconded by Vice Chairman Sobti the following resolution 
was unanimously passed:  
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Resolution No. 26-12 
The Board hereby moves to approve the ranking results and the contract award to offeror B subject 
to negotiation of fair and reasonable fees to be submitted at a time and in a format determined by 
GIAA. 
 
After the Board approved the ranking results, Offeror B was publicly announced as EMCA 
Consulting Engineers. 
 

C. Approval and Award of Management and Infrastructure Support Services for GIAAs 
Paging System − RFP No. RFP−011-−FY25 

 
DEM Hernandez presented this item to the Board. Board action was requested to approve the 
ranking results for Request for Proposals (RFP) No. RFP−011−FY25, Management and Infrastructure 
Support Services for the Paging System at the Antonio B. Won Pat International Airport, Guam 
(“GIAA”). 
 
The referenced Request for Proposals (RFP) solicits interest from qualified firms and/or individuals 
to provide professional management and infrastructure operational technology (“OT”) support 
services for GIAA’s public Paging System. The system provides paging through-out the terminal’s 
common areas to include the curb sides, departures and arrivals. Services in the scope of work 
include the management, administration, configuration, maintenance support and repair for the 
current paging system. 
 
The RFP was publicly announced in a local newspaper on September 10, 16 and 25, 2025. The 
deadline to submit proposals was October 2, 2025, at 4:00 p.m. 
 
A total of fifteen (15) firms and/or individuals downloaded the RFP package, and one (1) firm 
submitted a proposal before the submission deadline. 
 
The proposals were reviewed to determine responsiveness, that is, whether or not the offeror 
submitted all documents required by the RFP. The sole offeror submitted the required documents 
and was determined to be responsive as outlined in the Guam Procurement Law and Regulations. 
 
The Evaluation Committee appointed by the Executive Manager completed their evaluations of the 
proposal. As a result of the evaluations, it was determined that Offeror A met the standards of 
responsibility and responsiveness to perform the required services in accordance with the criteria 
set forth in the RFP. The score sheets were gathered and tabulated by the Procurement Office. 
 
On motion duly made by Director Morato, seconded by Director Alcorn, the following resolution 
was unanimously passed:  
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Resolution No. 26-13 
The Board hereby moves to approve the ranking results and the contract award to Offeror A subject 
to negotiation of fair and reasonable fees to be submitted at a time and in a format determined by 
GIAA. 
After the Board approved the ranking results, Offeror A was publicly announced as Secure Safe 
Solutions LLC. 
 

D. Approval and Award of Purchase and Delivery of Sports Utility Vehicles − IFB No. 
GIAA−004−FY25 

 
DEM Hernandez presented this item to the Board. Prior to beginning discussion, EM Quinata 
informed Board that he had recused himself related to his procurement. DEM Hernandez also 
informed the Board that Acting Guam Department of Administration, General Services Agency Chief 
Procurement Officer Adriana U. Quitugua supervised this procurement at GIAA’s request. Board 
action is requested to approve the award for Invitation for Bid (“IFB”) No. GIAA-004-FY25 for the 
Purchase and Delivery of Sports Utility Vehicles. Bids were solicited for purchase and delivery of 
Sport Utility Vehicles (“SUV”) to support the operational readiness and security functions of GIAA’s 
Airport Police Division (“APD”) as well as other GIAA divisions. In particular, the SUVs equipped with 
law enforcement uplifts will be designated for use by APD’s K9 Section. These vehicles are intended 
to quickly and efficiently transport K9 units for airport security operations, including responding to 
potential threats, and the detection of narcotics and explosives. 
 
The contract will be awarded to the responsive and responsible bidder(s) with the Lowest Total Bid 
Price within the available funding for the project, and provided the bid is reasonable and is in the 
best interest of GIAA to accept. The delivery time for this procurement is ninety (90) calendar days 
from the issuance of a Purchase Order. Section 11 of the Instructions to Bidders of the IFB allows for 
the purchase of a minimum of one (1) vehicle per line item, however, the actual quantities may 
exceed the minimum during the contract period of one (1) year from the date of award, based on 
operational needs and available funding. The contract period shall be one (1) year from the date of 
award. 
 
The IFB was publicly announced in a local newspaper on August 5, 11, 21, 28, and September 5, 
2025. The bid submission deadline was extended to October 10, 2025, 10:00 a.m. and bid opening 
took place on the same day at 10:15 a.m. 
 
Nine (9) prospective bidders downloaded the IFB package, and three (3) bidders submitted a bid 
prior to the bid submission deadline. The bids were opened publicly and read aloud by the Single 
Point of Contact and recorded by a member of the Procurement staff. 
 
The results of the submitted bids are as follows in the order that they were received and opened: 
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The government estimate for this project is $104,380.00. 
 
Triple J Enterprises, Inc.: The bidder submitted a total bid price of $134,800.00 or 29.14% above the 
government estimate. The bidder’s submittal was reviewed and deemed responsive through the 
submission of all required documents, completed and in conformance with the IFB, and bidder 
meets the standards of responsibility as set forth in the Procurement Law and Regulations. 
 
Monster Auto Corp dba Guam Auto Spot.: The bidder submitted a total bid price of $117,578.00 or 
12.64% above the government estimate. The bidder’s submittal was reviewed and deemed 
responsive through the submission of all required documents, completed and in conformance with 
the IFB, and bidder meets the standards of responsibility as set forth in the Procurement Law and 
Regulations. 
 
Cars Plus LLC.: The bidder submitted a total bid price of $154,490.00 or 48.01% above the 
government estimate. The bidder’s submittal was reviewed and deemed responsive through the 
submission of all required documents, completed and in conformance with the IFB, and bidder 
meets the standards of responsibility as set forth in the Procurement Law and Regulations. 
 
Upon Board approval, the award will be processed through the issuance of a purchase order in 
conformance with the Guam Procurement Law and Regulations, subject to legal review and GSA 
concurrence. 
 
The Project will be funded through Airport Police O &M Budget. 
 
On motion duly made by Vice-Chairman Sobti, seconded by Director Alcorn, the following resolution 
was unanimously passed:  
 

Resolution No. 26-14 
The Board hereby moves to approve the ranking results and the contract award of Purchase and 
Delivery of Sports Utility Vehicles to Monster Auto Corp. dba Guam Auto Spot who was the lowest 
bidder that has met the standard of responsibility and responsiveness outlined in Guam 
Procurement Law and Regulations presented. 
 

E. Ratification of FAA Grant Agreement No. GUM−WPG−3−66−0001−131−2025  
Cargo Apron − Design − Phase 2 
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The first item requiring Board action concerned FAA Grant Agreement No. 
GUM−WPG−3−66−0001−131−2025 Cargo Apron − Design − Phase 2, which Mr. Frank Santos, GIAA 
TMG Consultant presented. 
 
The board was asked to ratify FAA grant agreement AIP 131 for the Cargo Apron Design Phase 2.  
The project is currently at a 50% completion level and requires $1,215,000 to finish, with 90% federal 
and 10% airport funding.  The airport must appropriate its 10%, amounting to $135,000.  The design 
includes extending the fuel system, major grading work, apron construction, and a connecting 
taxiway.  The project is expected to be completed by the end of the first quarter of 2026 and bid out 
in FY26 grants.   
 
On motion duly made by Director Morato, seconded by Director Alcron, the following resolution 
was unanimously passed:  
 

Resolution No. 26-15 
The Board hereby moves to ratify Cargo Apron − Design − Phase 2 − FAA Grant Agreement No. 
3−66−0001−131−2025 in the amount of $1,215,00.00 
 

F. Ratification of FAA Grant Agreement No. GUM−WPG−3−66−0001−132−2025 TSA 
Security Screening Checkpoint Area Expansion − Design − Phase 1 

 
The next item presented was a request to the Board to ratify FAA Grant Agreement No. 
GUM−WPG−3−66−0001−132−2025 TSA Security Screening Checkpoint Area Expansion − Design − 
Phase 1 was also presented by Mr. Santos. AIP 132 will provide some funding, if not all when 
available to Item 6A for a particular design. FAA will contribute 10% with the airport sponsor will 
cover the remaining 90%.  This project aims to expand the queuing area by 40 feet on both sides, 
totaling 3,200 square feet, to improve capacity and safety, especially in light of the past 
overcrowding during peak times. The current queuing is insufficient, especially during the peak 
times in 2019 with passengers queuing down the stairway and all the way to the ticket counters.  
The design will also facilitate improvements in family lanes and other screening functions, as 
recommended by the airline and TSA. 
 
On motion duly made by Vice Chairman Sobti, seconded by Director Garcia, the following resolution 
was unanimously passed:  
 

Resolution No. 26-16 
The Board hereby ratifies TSA Security Screening Checkpoint Area Expansion − Design − Phase 1 & 
2 − FAA Grant Agreement No. GUM−WPG−3−66−0001−132−2025 in the amount of $975,000.00 
 

G. Ratification of FAA Grant Agreement No. GUM−WPG−3−66−0001−133−2025 
Reconstruct Airport Lighting Vault Equipment − Design − Phase 1 of 2 
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The next item presented by Mr. Santos concerned management’s request to ratify  FAA Grant 
Agreement No. GUM−WPG−3−66−0001−133−2025 Reconstruct Airport Lighting Vault Equipment − 
Design − Phase 1 of 2. Mr. Santos explained that this grant amounts to $800,000, which is at a split 
90/10 and is for Phase 1 of project 2, the airport must appropriate its 10% amounting to $88,889.  
The project focuses on the airfield lighting vault, which includes hardware and software systems, 
and can be managed remotely.  Both the Ramp Control Tower on the airport side as well as air traffic 
control can control the lighting from that vault.  
 
On motion duly made by Director Garcia, seconded by Chairman Bamba, the following resolution 
was unanimously passed:  
 

Resolution No. 26-17 
The Board hereby ratifies FAA Grant Agreement No. GUM-WPG-3-66-0001-133-2025 Reconstruct 
Airport Lighting Vault Equipment – Design – Phase 1 of 2 in the amount of $800,000.00.  
 
 

H. Ratification of FAA Grant Agreement No. GUM−WPG−3−66−0001−134−2025 VALE 
Infrastructure 

 
The last item needing ratification is FAA Grant Agreement No. GUM−WPG−3−66−0001−134−2025 
VALE Infrastructure which stands for Voluntary Airport Low Emissions. The total for this grant is 
$7,461,000 with a 10% match of $729,000.  This includes 17 units of ground power and 17 units of 
preconditioned air for each bridge, serving aircraft parked at those bridges. The project is in the bid 
documents drafting stage undergoing FAA and legal review and will be advertised for bids once 
cleared. The funding was highly competitive among U.S. airports and GIAA is fortunate to receive 
this funding. 
 
On option duly made by Director Alcorn, Seconded by Director Garcia the following resolution was 
unanimously passed: 
 

Resolution No. 26-18 
The Board hereby ratifies FAA Grant Agreement No. GUM-WPG-3-66-0001-134-2025 Vale 
Infrastructure in the amount of $729,000.00.  
 

I. Notice of GIAA Draft Policies and Procedures for Solicitation, Selection, and Award of 
Concession Agreements for Public Comment authorized by Public Law 38-21 
 

Reference is made for Notice of GIAA Draft Policies and Procedures for Solicitation, Selection, and 
Award of Concession Agreements for Public Comment authorized by Public Law 38-21 included as 
part of the Board’s packet, which was presented by DEM Hernandez. 
 
Public Law 38-21 provides authority to the A. B. Won Pat International Airport Authority, Guam 
(GIAA) to adopt policies and procedures for the solicitation, selection, and award of agreements 
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between the GIAA and any other party for the use of airport facilities and properties for airport 
purposes and/or visitor-related activities. 
 
Specifically, relative to concession agreements, Public Law 38-21 provides that such agreements 
shall be authorized for a term of up to fifteen (15) years and shall be subject to policies and 
procedures for the competitive solicitation, selection, and award of concession agreements adopted 
from time to time by the GIAA’s Board of Directors. The requirements of said policies and procedures 
and any amendments thereto are that they are based on industry standards, are competitive in 
nature, and consider the inclusion of small businesses in its adoption. Additionally, said policies and 
procedures shall not in any way authorize or permit gambling of any kind as defined in 9 GCA 
Chapter 64.  
 
Subsequent to the passage of Public Law 38-21, the Governor signed and promulgated Executive 
Order No. 2025-05 on August 1, 2025, relative to establishing requirements for adoption of policies 
and procedures for airport concessions. GIAA’s policies as drafted are aligned with this Executive 
Order to the extent they are required or applicable. 
 
The draft Concession Policies is recommended to be added to the Guam Administrative Rules and 
Regulations (GAR) under Title 4 (Commerce), Chapter 7B (Guam Airport Authority).   
 
In the drafting of the Concession Policies, the GIAA closely modelled the Guam Procurement Law (5 
GCA Chapter 5) and Regulations (2 GAR Division 4) to the extent applicable considering Guam 
Procurement Law and Regulations govern the purchase of goods, services, and construction 
whereas the draft Concession Policies are aimed at competitively soliciting for revenue-generating 
contracts. The modelling of the draft Concession Policies after Guam Procurement Law and 
Regulations ensures the standards of consistency, efficiency, competition, and fairness are upheld 
to ensure the best outcome and interests of the GIAA are maintained.  
 
As previously indicated, statute requires that the GIAA prepare a fiscal assessment which shall be 
posted with a copy of the Concession Policies on its website, allow for no less than thirty (30) 
calendar days for public comment, and to hold a public hearing noticed pursuant to 5 GCA § 8107 
(Open Government Law).  
 
The Fiscal Assessment shall directly address, at a minimum, the purpose and need for, the financial 
impact upon those persons or entities directly affected by, and the potential benefits expected to 
the GIAA by the proposed Concession Policies. Concessions include, but are not limited to retail, 
specialty retail, food and beverage, advertising, currency exchange, car rentals, and parking.  
 
A notice for public comments on the proposed Concession Policies and the required Fiscal 
Assessment was published in the newspaper on Friday, November 7, 2025, and available for viewing 
or download at www.guamairport.com.  GIAA will convene a public hearing no less than thirty (30) 
calendar days from said posting which falls sometime after December 8, 2025. No action was 
requested by management concerning this matter.  
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J. Notice of GIAA Draft Policies and Procedures for Solicitation, Selection, and Award of 

Leasing Agreements for Public Comment authorized by Public Law 38-21 
 
Reference is made for Notice of GIAA Draft Policies and Procedures for Solicitation, Selection, and 
Award of Leasing Agreements for Public Comment authorized by Public Law 38-21 included as part 
of the Board’s packet, which was presented by DEM Hernandez. 
 
Public Law 38-21 provides authority to the A. B. Won Pat International Airport Authority, Guam 
(GIAA) to adopt Lease Policies between the GIAA and any other party for the use of airport facilities 
and properties for airport purposes and/or visitor-related activities. 
 
Specifically, relative to lease agreements, Public Law 38-21 provides that such agreements shall be 
authorized for a term of up to fifty (50) years and shall be subject to applicable Federal Aviation 
Administration (FAA) requirements for aeronautical and non-aeronautical uses to include rates 
charged for non-aeronautical uses at fair market value pursuant to GIAA requirements and policies 
and procedures adopted from time to time by the GIAA Board of Directors. Additionally, said policies 
and procedures shall not in any way authorize or permit gambling of any kind as defined in 9 GCA 
Chapter 64.  
 
The purpose of these proposed Lease Policies is to provide standard policies and procedures 
governing the selection, award, and operation of airport leases, as may be amended from time to 
time, and in conformity with industry practices. This purpose includes the distinguishing between 
different categories of Leases, and the basis for corresponding differences in policy approach. 
 
As previously indicated, statute requires that the GIAA prepare a fiscal assessment which shall be 
posted with a copy of the proposed Lease Policies on its website, allow for no less than thirty (30) 
calendar days for public comment, and to hold a public hearing noticed pursuant to 5 GCA § 8107 
(Open Government Law). 
 
The Fiscal Assessment shall directly address, at a minimum, the purpose and need for, the financial 
impact upon those persons or entities directly affected by, and the potential benefits expected to 
the GIAA by the proposed Lease Policies. 
 
The GIAA is expecting to post both the proposed Lease Policies and the associated Fiscal Assessment 
no later than the end of next week. No action was requested by management concerning this item. 
 
7. REPORT OF THE EXECUTIVE MANAGER 
 
Reference is made for the Executive Manager’s Report included as part of the Board’s packet, which 
was presented by EM Quinata. The report included brief updates on Passenger Flight Network for 
November 2025, Air Service Snapshot for November 2025 there is a 40% increase in the number of 
flights and a 51% increase in seat capacity, as compared to November 2025. Airline Updates, Federal 
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Regulatory Updates, Facilities and Infrastructure, Training, Procurement Updates, and 
Announcements. 
 
8. REPORT OF THE COMPTROLLER 
 
Reference is made for the Comptroller’s Report included as part of the Board’s packet, which was 
presented by Ms. Dafne Mansapit Shimizu.  Charts of Signatory Enplanements v. Total Revenues (in 
millions) for FY 2019 – FY 2024, Signatory Enplanements – Actual vs Forecasted FY  2019 – FY 2025, 
and Enplaned Signatory Pax FY2024 – FY2025 (as of Sept 2025). 
 
Update on short term financing effort.  The Comptroller updated the Board on  RFP 25-007 issued 
by GEDA pursuant to 12 G.C.A § 50103(k)on September 4, 2025. The proposal deadline was 
September 18, 2025. The GEDA Board approved the ranking of offerors and authorized GEDA 
management to commence negotiations. The matter is pending negotiations with FHB. 
 
9. EXECUTIVE SESSION   
 
EM Quinata advised that there was no Executive Session on the agenda. 
 
10. PUBLIC COMMENTS 
 
EM Quinata advised there was no Public Comments at this time. 
 
11. ADJOURNMENT  
 
Motion to adjourn duly made by Vice-Chairman Sobti, seconded by Director Garcia; motion 
unanimously passed. The meeting was adjourned at 5:00 p.m. 
 
Dated this     19    day of     December     2025. 

 
 
 
 

 
 
 
     
Brian J. Bamba 
Chairman 

 
Attest: 
 
      
Donald I. Weakley 
Board Secretary 

 
 
Prepared and Submitted by: 
     
Wana Frances C. Wintterle 
Corresponding Secretary 



ANTONIO B. WON PAT INTERNATIONAL AIRPORT AUTHORITY, GUAM 
BOARD OF DIRECTORS 

EXECUTIVE SUMMARY 

INVITATION FOR BID 

IFB NO. GIAA-005-FY25 

PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF ZERO EMISSION VEHICLES AND CHARGING STATIONS 

December 19, 2025 

Purpose 

Board action is requested to approve the award for Invitation for Bid (“IFB”) No. GIAA-004-FY25 for the 
Purchase and Delivery of Zero Emission Vehicles and Charging Stations. 

Background 

Bids were solicited for purchase and delivery of Sport Utility Vehicles (“SUV”) to support the GIAA’s 
operations, maintenance and safety requirements. As Guam’s only commercial airport, GIAA’s 24/7 
operational demand require vehicles to maintain its facilities, respond to emergencies and ensure safety 
and security to its various properties, all stakeholders and the traveling public. Zero Emissions Vehicles 
will also afford cost savings and support of GIAA’s goal of Zero Emissions in conformance with FAA’s 
modernization and Reform Act of 2012 - Zero Emission Airport Vehicles and Infrastructure, and its 
subsequent amendment under 49 U.S.C. §47136. 

Procurement Background 

The IFB was publicly announced in a local newspaper on September 18, 25 and October 14, 2025. The bid 
submission deadline was extended to November 17, 2025, 10:00 a.m. and bid opening took place on the 
same day at 10:15 a.m. 

Sixteen (16) prospective bidders downloaded the IFB package, and two (2) bidders submitted a bid prior 
to the bid submission deadline. The bids were opened publicly and read aloud by the Single Point of 
Contact and recorded by a member of the Procurement staff. 

The results of the submitted bids are as follows in the order that they were received and opened: 

Item Description 
Cars Plus, LLC. Triple J Enterprises, Inc. 

Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price 

Line Item No. 1 
2024 (or newer) Zero 
Emission Sedan (2 each) $62,002.00 $124,004.00 No Bid N/A 

Line Item No. 2 
2024 (or newer) Zero 
Emission Sedan with Law 
Enforcement Uplift (3 each) $69,202.00 $207,606.00 $84,222.00 $252,666.00 
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Item Description 
Cars Plus, LLC. Triple J Enterprises, Inc. 

Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price 

Line Item No. 3 
2024 (or newer) Zero 
Emission Truck (2 each) No Bid N/A No Bid N/A 

Line Item No. 4 
Level III 50KW DC Fast 
Charging Station (3 each) No Bid N/A $78,947.00 $236,841.00 

Cars Plus LLC.: The bidder’s submittal was reviewed and deemed responsive through the submission of 
all required documents, completed and in conformance with the IFB, and bidder meets the standards of 
responsibility as set forth in the Procurement Law and Regulations. 

Triple J Enterprises, Inc.: The bidder’s submittal was reviewed and deemed responsive through the 
submission of all required documents, completed and in conformance with the IFB, and bidder meets the 
standards of responsibility as set forth in the Procurement Law and Regulations. 

Legal Review 

Upon Board approval, the award will be processed through the issuance of a purchase order in 
conformance with the Guam Procurement Law and Regulations, subject to legal review and GSA 
concurrence. 

The delivery time for this procurement is Three Hundred and Sixty (360) calendar days from the issuance 
of a Purchase Order.  

Financial Review 

The Project will be funded through a Federal Aviation Administration (“FAA”) Airport Improvement Plan 
(“AIP”) grant. 

Recommendation 

Pursuant to IFB, Instructions to Bidders, Section 12, the procurement will be awarded in the total amount 
of $568,851.00 to the responsive and responsible bidder(s) with the Lowest Total Bid Price for Each Item, 
as indicated below: 

Bidder Awarded Item Numbers Total Amount 

Cars Plus, LLC Item No. 1 & 2 $331, 610.00 

Triple J Enterprises, Inc. Item No. 4 $236,841.00 

Total Awarded Amount: $568,451.00 

Line Item No. 3 will not be awarded, as neither bidder submitted a bid price. 



 
 
 

                       EMAIL: official@guamairport.net 
 

 

  
 
       December 11, 2025 
 
 
MEMORANDUM 
TO:  Andriana U. Quitugua 
  Acting Chief Procurement Officer 
 
VIA:  Jean M. Arriola 
  Airport Services Manager 
 
FROM:  Kathrina Bayson 
  Supply Management Administrator 
 
SUBJECT: Bid Evaluation and Recommendation – Invitation For Bid (“IFB”) 

Purchase and Delivery of Zero Emission Vehicles and Charging Stations 
IFB No. GIAA-005-FY25 

 
Project Background: 
The IFB is for the purchase and delivery of Zero Emission Vehicles and Charging Stations to support GIAA’s operations, 
maintenance and safety requirements. As Guam’s only commercial airport, GIAA’s 24/7 operational demand require 
vehicles to maintain its facilities, respond to emergencies and ensure safety and security to its various properties, all 
stakeholders and the traveling public. Zero Emissions Vehicles will also afford cost savings and support of GIAA’s goal 
of Zero Emissions in conformance with FAA’s modernization and Reform Act of 2012 - Zero Emission Airport Vehicles 
and Infrastructure, and its subsequent amendment under 49 U.S.C. §47136. 
 
Procurement Background: 
The IFB was publicly announced in a local newspaper on September 18, 25 and October 14, 2025. The bid submission 
deadline was extended to November 17, 2025, 10:00 a.m. and bid opening took place on the same day at 10:15 a.m. 
 
Sixteen (16) prospective bidders downloaded the IFB package, and two (2) bidders submitted a bid prior to the bid 
submission deadline. The bids were opened publicly and read aloud by the Single Point of Contact and recorded by a 
member of the Procurement staff. 
 
The results of the submitted bids are as follows in the order that they were received and opened: 
 

Item Description 
Cars Plus, LLC. Triple J Enterprises, Inc. 

Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price 

 
Line Item No. 1 
2024 (or newer) Zero Emission 
Sedan (2 each) $62,002.00 $124,004.00 No Bid N/A 
Line Item No. 2 
2024 (or newer) Zero Emission 
Sedan with Law Enforcement 
Uplift (3 each) $69,202.00 $207,606.00 $84,222.00 $252,666.00 

















PURCHASE AND DELIVEBY OF ZERO EMISSION

VEHICLES AND CHARGING 5TATIONS IFB NO. G]AA.OOs,FY25

AFFIDAVIT DISCTOSING OWNERSHIP, INFTUENCE, COMMISSIONS AND CONFtICTS OF INTEREST

uired 5 GCA 5233 as amended P.L. L

ctry oF TAiIUNING 
)

5S.

ISTAND OF GUAM USA

Preface. As a condition of submitting a Bid/Offer/Proposal or responding to any method of source

selection under Guam's Procurement Law for the purpose of entering into a contract with the government

of Guam, this Affidavit requires all Bidders/Offerors/Prospective Contractors to make disclosures of
ownership, influence, commissions, gratuities, kickbacks, and conflicts of interest occurring during the
365 calendar days preceding the publication of this solicitation and until award of a contract. This

includes the duty to disclose any changes to the facts disclosed herein throughout the solicitation process;

and if the entity submitting this Affidavit is awarded a contract, the duty to disclose any changes to the
facts disclosed herein continues throughout the life of the contract, including any extensions or
renewals.

l, the undersigned, being first duly sworn, depose and say that I am an authorized representative
of the Bidder/Offeror/Prospective Contractor and that (please check and fill out all that apply):

t ] The Bidder/Offeror/Prospective Contractor is an individual with a business license, and all

decisions are by, and all profit is for, that same individual, with principal place of business

A

tl The Bidder/Offeror/Prospective Contractor is a business or artificial person (as defined
in 1 GCA E 715 or 5 GCA SS 5030(n) or 5233(b)), and is a sole proprietorship owned entir€ly
(100%) by 

- 

with principal place of business
street address being

N The Bidder/Offeror/Prospective Contractor is a business or artificial person (as defined
in 1 GCA 5 715 or 5 GCA 55 5030(n) or 5233(b)), and is owned by the following multiple
individuals. Note: owners of more than 10% are statutorily required to be listed below,
but other owners of smaller percentage are encouraged to be listed as well.

Name of Owner Principal Place of Business

Street Address

Triple J Oistributors, lnc 4?0 No.lh Maine Co.ps DrjveTam., GU t6913 22./.%

Three Jones Children lrrevoc.ble Trust Address s.me as above 11 6%

Roberl H Jones Trustee of lhe Su.vivols Trust Add.ess s.me as above 269%

%of
lnterest

Ro bert H J. nes Trustee ol lhe Ma ral6l Deduclion T.ust Address sam e as a bove

Robert H. JonesTrustee ol the FamilyTrust Addr€ss same as above

19 8r.

AFFIDAVIT OISCLOSING OWNERSHIP, INFLU ENCE, COMMISSIONS AND CONFLICTS OF INTEREST

14.1%

)

)

street address being:

Pa8e 1of 4



PURCHASE AND DETIVERY OF ZERO EMISSION

VEHICLES AND CHARGING STATIONS IFB NO, GIAA.OO5.FY25

Name of >10% Owner Business or Artificial Person: LISTED BELOW

txl

Names of owners of the >10%
Owner Business or Artificial

Person ("Second Tier
Owner")

Owner's Principal Place of Business Street Address

R. Daniet & Julie J Murrett 4?0 North Marine Corps orive, Tamuning, Gu.m 96913 30% of Triple
Group Dislrib(

Jeflrey 8. & Rebecca Jones Trusl same as above 30% ol Tripte
Group Distrib

Jay B. Jones & Deane Jessee-lones 30% of Tripte -
Group Dislribr

Name of other >10% Owner Business or Artificial Person: N/A

Aulo

Names of owners of the
>10% Owner Business or
Artificial Person ("Second

Tier ownel/, )

Owner's Principal Place of Business Street Address
%of

lnterest

N/A

B lf any Second Tier Owner identified above is an artificial person, the natural or artificial owners of
such Second Tier Owner who have held more lhan 49% of the shares or interest in the
Bidder/Offeror/Prospective Contractor (Third Tier Owners) are as follows [if none, please so

statel:

second Tier owner Name R0BERT H. J0NES

Name of Owner Principal Place of Business

Street Address
%of
lnterest

Robert H J ones a70 Norlh Marine Corps Drive, Tamuning, Guam 96913 100% of Trusis

C. lf the name of no natural person has been identified as an owner, or a Second or Third Tier Owner

AFFIOAVIT DISCLOSING OWNERSHIP, INFLUENCE, COMMISSIONS ANO CONFLICTS OF INTEREST Page 2 of4

One or more of the more-than-10% owners listed above is a business or artificial person.
Any more-than-25% owners of such business or artificial person are listed below per 5

GCA S 5233. Note: any less-than-25% owners of such a business or artificial person lS

encouraged to also be listed below.

Y. ot
lnterest
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of the Bidder/Offeror/Prospective Contractor, please identify the name, position, address, and
contact information of the natural person having the authority and responsibility for the
Bid/Offer/Proposal/Prospective Contract, and the name of any natural person who has the
authority and power to remove and replace the designated responsible person:

Name of Natural Person
Position

Street Address of
Principal Place of

Business

Phone Number, Email
Address, and other
Contact lnformation

N/A

Further, I say that the persons who have received or are entitled to receive a commission, gratuity,
contingent fee or other compensation to solicit, secure, or assist in obtaining business related to
the Bid/Offer/Proposal/Prospective Contract for which this Affidavit is submitted are as follows
(if none, please so state):

Name Principal Place of Business

Street Address

E

None

Further, I say that the persons who have directly or indirectly participated in this solicitation and
who are also employees of the government of Guam or the government of the United States, if
federal funds are to be used in the payment of the contract related to the
Bid/Offer/Proposal/Prospective Contract for which this Affidavit is submitted, are as follows (if
none, please so state):

Name Principal Place of Business Street Address
None

Regardless of any ownership interest, the following individuals have the power to control the
performance of the contract or to control the Bidder/Offeror/Prospective Contractor, directly or
indirectly:

Name Principal Place of Business Street Address
N/A

AFFIOAVIT DISCLOSING OWNERSHIP, INFTUENCE, COMMISSIONS AND CONFLICTS OF INTEREST Page 3 of4
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VEHICLES AND CHARGING STATIONS

G

IFB NO. GIAA,OOs.FYz5

Until award of the contract, and throughout the term of any contract awarded to the
Bidder/Offeror/Prospective Contractor represented herein, I agree to promptly make any

disclosures not made previously and update changes in ownership, identities of owners and other
required information, interests, compensation or conflicts of the persons req uired to be disclosed.

I understand that failure to comply with this requirement shall constitute a material breach of
contract.

H I hereby declare under penalty of perjury under the laws of Guam that the foregoing is true and

correct.

Executed on: 0 ctob er 17,2025
(date)

Jay
Exec esident
Signature the following
Bidder/Offer or pective Contractor, if a
licensed individual Owner of sole proprietorship
Bidder/Offeror/Prospective Contractor Pa rtner,
if the Bidder/Offeror/Prospective Contractor is a
partnership
Off icer, if the Bidder/Off eror/Prospective
Contractor is a corporation

Subscrrbed and sworn to before me

This lTth day of october .2 025

NO ARY PU LIC

M comm tsston exprres iqJc 01 f v?C

PHII,IPM.NAVARRO
NOTARY PUBLIC

In srdfor the Tcrriiory of Guun, U.S.A.
My Commission Expires: JUNE 07, 2026

Culrn 96929IE7 A

AEFIDAVIT DISCTOSING OWNERSHIP, INFLUENCE, COMMISSIONS AND CONFLICTS OT INTEREST

THIS AFFIDAVIT MUST BE COMPLETED AND RETURNED IN THE ENVETOPE CONTAINING THE BID.
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AIR SERVICE SNAPSHOT 
For December 2025 there is a 50% increase in the number of flights and a 58% increase in seat capacity, as 
compared to December 2024.  The increases in both flights and seat capacity are attributed to the  

•  Air Seoul’s 3x daily operation from Incheon 
•  Air Busan’s 2x daily operation from Busan 
• Korean Air’s two daily wide body operations from Incheon, and one daily narrow body from Busan  

 

PASSENGER FLIGHT NETWORK: DECEMBER 2025

AIRLINE ROUTE FLIGHT   # 
(Arriving/Departing) ETA/ETD

OPERATING DAYS  
(ORIGINATING/DEPARTING 

GUAM)
AIRLINE ROUTE FLIGHT   # 

(Arriving/Departing) ETA/ETD
OPERATING DAYS  

(ORIGINATING/DEPARTING 
GUAM)

HNL UA201U/UA200 1850/0740 Daily
Japan Airlines NRT JL941/JL942 1440/1640 Daily

HND UA849/UA848 0420/1920 Daily Phillipine Airlines MNL PR110/PR111 0430/0600 Daily 

CEB PR120/121 0325/0515 Wed, Fri & Sun Eff. Dec 17

UA873/UA874 0145/1700 Daily, effective Dec. 9 ICN KE417/KE418 2305/0100 Daily

UA827/UA828 1545/1700 Daily Korean Air ICN KE8425/8426 0000/0240 Daily

UA197/UA196 2145/1230 Daily ICN KE415/KE416 1435/1650 Daily Effective Aug. 1- Dec. 31, 
2025

UA865/UA864 2240/1330 Mon & Fri/Tue & Sat ICN KE8419/KE8420 2005/2150 Daily Effective Dec. 11- 31, 
2025

PUS KE2259/2260 0130/0315 Daily Effective Augb1- Dec. 31, 
2025

KIX UA150/UA151 1540/0705 Daily                                       Ops 
on Wed & Sat 0720/1555 ICN LJ919/LJ920 2300/0020 Daiy

NGO UA136/UA137 1615/0730 Sun, Mon, Tue, Thur, Fri
Jin Air

ICN LJ917/LJ918 0120/0230 Daily 

United Airlines MNL UA184/UA183 0445/1955 Daily ETA on Wed &Sat 0625 ICN LJ913/L914 1500/1610 Daily

UA158/UA157 0510/2340 Mon, Wed, Thur,Sun/Mon, Tue, 
Thu, Fri

PUS LJ921/LJ922 0050/0150 Daily

UA193/UA192 0645/1955

Wed, Sat/Thu, Sun.          UA193 
will return as UA156 on Wed/Sat 
@0625 and will depart as UA183 
on Tue/Fri @1955 

PUS LJ923/LJ924 1515/1615 Daily effective Nov. 25- Dec. 
16, 2025

SPN UA076/UA174 0645//0800 Daily, ETA 1035 on Sun/Tue, Thu 
& Sat

TPE UA166/UA165 1650/0730 Wednesday and Saturday
T'Way Airlines KIX TW509/TW510 1520/1620 Daily

TKK
UA133/UA132 1740/0825

Thu & Sun/Wed & Sat.                
ETA on Sun @1635 and ETD on 
Sat @0930   

ICN RS101/RS102 0100/0200 Daily Effective October 27, 
2025

UA154/UA155 1825/0755 Tue & Fri/Mon & Thu
Air Seoul

ICN RS103/RS104 1630/1730 Daily Effective Nov. 15- Dec. 
31, 2025

PNI UA176/UA176 0330/2020 Mon/Sun
ICN RS105/RS106 1340/1440 Daily Effective Nov. 15- Dec. 

31, 2025

Yap UA186/UA185 0400/2335 Wed & Sun/Tue & Sat Air Busan PUS BX614/BX613 0230/0330 Daily Effective October 27, 
2025

Jeju Airlines ICN 7C3101/3102 1605/1710 Supended through March 2026
PUS BX618/BX617 0120/0240 Daily effective Nov. 1 - Dec. 

31, 2025

ICN 7C3107/7C3108 0200/0305 October 1-12 only Star Marianas ROP **3401/**4301 1200/1230 Mon, Tue, Wed, Thu, Fri

Air Service Changes November 2025 vs. October 2025):
Korean Air to operate 1 extra wide body flight from Incheon daily effective Dec. 11- 31
Jin Air will operate 1 extra flight from Incheon on Dec. 1 only
Tway to operate eight charters (2 FUK, 3 NRT, 1 KIX and 3 ICN) from Dec 27- Jan 4

NRT

ROR
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AIRLINE UPDATES 
 
United Airlines refreshes its Ticket Counters  
United Airlines has refreshed its ticket counters with new kiosks, tiling and lighting in the Ticket 
Lobby and celebrated its refreshed look with a ribbon cutting held on December 1, 2025.  There-
configured and redesigned United ticketing area is more customer-centric, with the check-in kiosks 
staged in a two-step configuration to reduce congestion and wait times. United’s kiosks are 
designed to be accessible to all customers.    
 
New and Upcoming Flights 
 
Philippine Airlines inaugural flight from Cebu landed at 3:25 am with PAL dignitary Gigi Tan, 
accompanied by Governor Lou Leon Guerrero, Senator Jesse A. Lujan, GIAA Chairman Bamba, 
Directors Sobti and GVB Board members Joaquin Cook and Robert Ho[man and President & CEO 
Regine Biscoe Lee.  The flight will operate 3x weekly from Cebu e[ective Dec. 17, 2025, adding 
2,388 seats monthly. 
 
Korean Air will operate an additional wide body afternoon flight from December 11 – 31, 2025 
adding 3,822 seats for this time period, and will bring their daily operations from 4 to 5 flights daily 
to the end of the year.  
 
T’way will operate 6 end-of-the year charter flights (2 Fukuoka, 3 Narita, 1 Kansai and 3 Incheon) 
from December 27 through January 4, 2026, adding 1,701 seats for this time period.  
 
Starlux Airlines will operate 6 charters from Taipei from February 14 -23, 2025, adding 1,128 seats 
from this seasonal operation.  
 
 
 
 

CY 2024 CY 2025 % Percentage Change
# of 

Flights
Seat 

Capacity
Enplane-

ments
# of 

Flights
Seat 

Capacity
Enplane-

ments
# of 

Flights
Seat 

Capacity
Enplane-

ments
January 816 148,616 101,439   638 117,030 93,473 -22% -21% -8%
February 712 129,083 94,082     580 109,989 85,652 -19% -15% -9%
March 695 112,091 87,147 639 120,937 92,382 -8% 8% 6%
April 622 115,790 79,104 601 113,814 78,651 -3% -2% -1%
May 703 128,368 84,152     590 111,676 82,721 -16% -13% -2%
June 633 115,976 85,672     581 113,959 88,319 -8% -2% 3%
July 653 119700 86,066     655 126,624 94,702 0% 6% 10%
August 649 120,587   83,950 777 148,015 110,837 20% 23% 32%

September 955 179,078   72,993 728 143,933 81,125    -24% -20% 11%
October 651 119,723   79,471     733 145,462 N/A 13% 21% N/A
November 564 105,439   78,848     791 159,237 N/A 40% 51% N/A
December 619 115,650 94,982     927 183,333 N/A 50% 59% N/A
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REGULATORY UPDATES 
 
TSA to impose fee for Air Travelers without a REAL ID or Passport 
E[ective February 1, 2025, air travelers without a REAL ID or other acceptable form of 
Identification, such as a passport, will be charged $45 USD to verify their identification.   TSA urges 
all travelers who do not have a REAL ID to pay the fee online before traveling and individuals may 
register for the TSA Confirm.ID program at TSA.gov.   TSA’s list of acceptable forms of ID can be 
found at TSA.gov/travel/security-screening/identification. 
 
LEGISLATIVE UPDATES 
 
The 38th Guam Legislature confirmed Director Doyon Morato to serve another term as a member of 
the GIAA Board of Directors at the December 5, 2025, regular legislative session and o[icially 
forwarded to Governor Lou Leon Guerrero on December 9, 2025.  We congratulate Director Morato 
and thank her for her continued valuable service to the community and to the agency.  
 
FACILITIES & INFRASTRUCTURE  
 
Terminal Flooring Project Nearing Completion.  
The terminal terrazzo flooring project is anticipated to be completed in the first quarter of 2026.   
GIAA has received positive comments on the new floor from passengers and employees alike, 
stating that it enhances the environment and gives the terminal a sense of place, provides smooth 
rolling of carts and luggage and visual experience as if walking in ocean water.   
 
 
ANNOUNCEMENTS 
 

• GIAA held a public hearing for the Proposed for the Competitive Solicitation, Selection and 
Award of Concession Agreements at the A. B. Won Pat International Airport. Guam on 
December 16, 2023, at 3pm.   

• GIAA’s mini float entry for the Governor’s 4th Annual Christmas in Paradise event held on 
December 17, 2025, was an overwhelming success and featured a highly illuminated snow 
globe complete with Christmas Wonder.   Kudos to the Christmas float team for a 
successful entry!  

• GIAA will hold a public hearing for Proposed Policies and Procedures for the Solicitation, 
Award, and Operation of Lease Agreements at the A. B. Won Pat International Airport, Guam 
on December 22, 2025 @ 3pm.   
 
 

http://tsa.gov/
https://links-2.govdelivery.com/CL0/https:%2F%2Fwww.tsa.gov%2Ftravel%2Fsecurity-screening%2Fidentification/1/0101019adaed595c-96865191-bcc2-43a1-965f-d5ac642ae099-000000/OolXH2EJrqwNHp8pKwLnzpPoLnVSLa90uiGmDJ_m-Hs=433










78,098 

81,899 

96,249 
101,039 

93,224  94,758 

73,993 

83,219 

83,744 
85,581 

92,762 

70,937 

78,037 
78,692 

94,752  93,152 

85,519 

90,774  77,474 

82,267 

85,992 

93,442 

109,752 

80,605 

86,977 

94,129 

 ‐

 20,000

 40,000

 60,000

 80,000

 100,000

 120,000

October November December January February March April May June July August September

Comptroller's Report
Attachment #1

Enplaned Signatory Pax
FY 2024 ‐ FY 2026 (as of Nov 2025)

FY2024 FY 2025 FY2026



Comptroller's Report
Attachment #2

Enplaned Signatory Pax v Number of Flights

 -

 500

 1,000

 1,500

 2,000

 2,500

 3,000

 3,500

 -

 20,000

 40,000

 60,000

 80,000

 100,000

 120,000

Oct Nov Dec Jan Feb Mar Apr May Jun Jul Aug Sep Oct Nov Dec Jan Feb Mar Apr May Jun Jul Aug Sep Oct

2023 2024 2025

Sum of Enplaned Signatory Pax

Sum of Number of Flights

Values

  

Sum of Enplaned Signatory PaxSum of Number of Flights


	8. Report of Comptroller.pdf
	Comptroller Report - Attachment 2 Enplaned Pax v No. of Flights - FY25 -2025.11.pdf
	Graph





